
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS OCTOBER 5, 2011

     RFB #11-0195

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

1. Ea, Brush Trucks with Flat Beds 2 $36,191.00 $72,382.00 $38,249.00 $76,498.00

Make/Model

2. Operator's Manual 1 Paper/CD ROM $0.00 Paper/CD ROM $0.00

3. Service/Maintenance Repair Manual 1 Paper/CD ROM $225.00 Paper/CD ROM $0.00

4. Electrical Diagrams 1 Paper/CD ROM $79.00 Paper/CD ROM $0.00

5. Emissions Diagnoses Manual 1 Paper/CD ROM $145.00 Paper/CD ROM $0.00

Grand total $72,831.00 $76,498.00

Delivery date

Acknowledge Addenda

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

1. Ea, Brush Trucks with Flat Beds 2 $33,929.00 $67,858.00 $34,115.00 $68,230.00

Make/Model

2. Operator's Manual 1 Paper/CD ROM $0.00 Paper/CD ROM $25.00

3. Service/Maintenance Repair Manual 1 Paper/CD ROM $0.00 Paper/CD ROM $177.00

4. Electrical Diagrams 1 Paper/CD ROM $149.00 Paper/CD ROM $45.00

5. Emissions Diagnoses Manual 1 Paper/CD ROM $0.00 Paper/CD ROM $55.00

Grand total $68,007.00 $68,532.00

Delivery date

Acknowledge Addenda

2012 Ford F350 Super Duty 4WD 2012 Ford F350 4WD 

6-8 weeks 90-120 days

Y

30 days aro chassis 30 days aro chassis

Y N 

Qty
Rusty Eck Ford Shawnee Mission Ford

Qty
Danko Emergency Equipment Ralph A Johnson Co., Inc.

2012 Ford F350 Super Duty 4WD
2012 Chevy Silverado 3500HD 

4WD w/wrangler flat bed

1. BRUSH TRUCKS -- SEDGWICK COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT #1

FUNDING -- SEDGWICK COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT #1

(Request sent to 38 vendors)

ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL 

5 Items
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Unit Price Ext Price

1. Ea, Brush Trucks with Flat Beds 2 $34,400.00 $68,800.00

Make/Model

2. Operator's Manual 1 Paper/CD ROM $0.00

3. Service/Maintenance Repair Manual 1 Paper/CD ROM $0.00

4. Electrical Diagrams 1 Paper/CD ROM $0.00

5. Emissions Diagnoses Manual 1 Paper/CD ROM $0.00

Grand total $68,800.00

Delivery date

Acknowledge Addenda

60-120 days

Y

KW Truck Equipment, LLC

NO BIDS

Fleet Sales, LLC

Northcutt, Inc.

Kansas Truck Center

Stamm Manufacturing

Sellers Equipment Inc

Qty
Don Hattan Chevrolet, Inc.

Cheverolet CK31403

On the recommendation of Dallas Shaffer, on behalf of the Sedgwick County Fire District # 1, David Spears moved to accept the low 

bid from Rusty Eck Ford in the amount of $68,007.00. Jennifer Dombaugh seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

Question: What is a Brush Truck?  The Brush Trucks are used for grass fires and ground covers plus supports the other fire trucks as 

needed.  These are replacement trucks and are past their service life.  They will be sold on PurpleWave.
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     RFB #11-0187

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

1.  John Bean Hydraulic Sprayer tank with Spray 

Equipment;  Model # DO35/300
2 $26,204.00 $52,408.00 $22,569.24 $45,138.48

2.  Raven Six (6) Switch console with serial Interface; 

Model # SCS 450
2 $3,200.00 $6,400.00 $2,228.29 $4,456.58

3.  Hydraulic Sprayer - Manual 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

4.  System Controller - Manual 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Grand total $58,808.00 $49,595.06

Delivery date

Acknowledge Addendum

Qty

1.  John Bean Hydraulic Sprayer tank with Spray 

Equipment;  Model # DO35/300
2 no bid no bid

YY

approx 90 days 31-Oct-11

Qty
Minnesota Wanner Company Fairbank Equipment Inc

Rhodes Chemical Co OESCO,Inc

2.  HYDRAULIC SPRAY APPARATUS -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

(Request sent to seven vendors)

On the recommendation of Brandy McCune, on behalf of Fleet Management, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to accept 

the low bid from Fairbank Equipment Inc. in the amount of $49,595.06. Linda Kizzire seconded the motion. The 

motion passed unanimously.

These are replacements for Noxious Weeds. This is the equipment installed on the trucks that spray ditches and other 

areas. This equipment is replaced with every other truck purchase due to typical wear on the equipment. This purchase 

will replace two systems that are about 12-15 years old.

Surplus will be sold on Purple Wave. 

Note: This purchase was previously approved by the Bid Board on February 24, 2011 on RFB #11-0030, however, the 

awarded vendor, Vegetation Management Supply, Inc., has since gone out of business before they were able to provide 

equipment delivery; therefore this item had to go back out for bid. The original bid was $47,957.87. 
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     RFB #11-0185

Item #1 Qty

Landmark 

Dodge, Inc

Shawnee Mission 

Ford

Don Hattan 

Chevrolet
Rusty Eck Ford

1. Supercrew Special Service Pickup Truck 1
$23,999.35 $27,558.00 $26,950.00 no bid

Make/Model

2012 Dodge 1500 

Quad ST 4x4

2012 Ford F-150 

Crew Cab 4x4

2012 Chevrolet 

Silverado 1500 

4x4 Crew Cab

2. Manuals - One Complete Set 1 $0.00 $256.00 $0.00

Grand total $23,999.35 $27,814.00 $26,950.00

Delivery date 60-90 days 90-120 days ARO 60-90 days

Item #2 Qty

Landmark 

Dodge, Inc

Shawnee Mission 

Ford

Don Hattan 

Chevrolet
Rusty Eck Ford

1. 3/4 Ton 4WD 4-Door Extended Cab 

Pickup Truck 1
$23,999.35 $26,782.00 $25,350.00 $26,367.00

Make/Model

2012 Dodge 2500 

Crew ST 4x4

2012 Ford F-250  

Ext. Cab 4x4

2012 Chevrolet 

Silverado 2500HD 

4WD Ext. Cab

2012 Ford F-250 

Super Cab

2. Manuals - One Complete Set 1 $0.00 $256.00 $0.00 $149.00

Grand total $23,999.35 $27,038.00 $25,350.00 $26,516.00

Delivery date 60-90 days 90-120 days ARO 60-90 days 7-8 weeks

3.  VARIOUS PICKUP TRUCKS -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

(Request sent to 56 vendors)
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Item #3 Qty

Landmark 

Dodge, Inc

Shawnee Mission 

Ford

Don Hattan 

Chevrolet
Rusty Eck Ford

1. 3/4 Ton 4-Door Crew Cab Pickup Truck 1
$24,353.25 $25,899.00 $24,610.00 $25,532.00

Make/Model

2012 Dodge 2500 

Crew ST 4x4

2012 Ford F-250 

Crew Cab 4x2

2012 Chevrolet 

Silverado 2500HD 

2WD Crew Cab

2012 Ford F-250 

Crew Cab 2WD

2.  Ea, Manuals - One Complete Set 1 $0.00 $256.00 $0.00 $149.00

Grand total $24,353.25 $26,155.00 $24,610.00 $25,681.00

Delivery date 60-90 days 90-120 days ARO 60-90 days 7-8 weeks

Item #4 Qty

Landmark 

Dodge, Inc

Shawnee Mission 

Ford

Don Hattan 

Chevrolet
Rusty Eck Ford

1. 3/4 Ton 4WD 4-Door Crew Cab Pickup 

Trucks 3

$24,515.25 ea. 

$73,545.75

$28,318.00 ea.           

$84,954.00

$26,350.00 ea. 

$79,050.00

$27,956.00 ea. 

$83,868.00

Make/Model

2012 Dodge 2500 

Crew ST 4x4

2012 Ford F-250 

Crew Cab 4x4

2012 Chevrolet 

Silverado 2500HD 

4WD Crew Cab

2012 Ford F-250  

Crew Cab 4WD

2.  Ea, Manuals - One Complete Set 1 $0.00 $256.00 $0.00 $149.00

Grand total $73,545.75 $85,210.00 $79,050.00 $84,017.00

Delivery date 60-90 days 90-120 days ARO 60-90 days 7-8 weeks



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS OCTOBER 5, 2011

Item #5 Qty

Landmark Dodge, 

Inc

Shawnee Mission 

Ford

Don Hattan 

Chevrolet
Rusty Eck Ford

1. 4WD 4-Door Extended cab Pickup Trucks 3
no bid

$26,227.00 ea. 

$78,831.00

$24,750.00 ea. 

$74,250.00
no bid

Make/Model

2012 Ford F-150  

Ext. Cab 4x4

2012 Chevrolet 

Silverado 1500 

4WD Ext. Cab

2. Manuals - One Complete Set 1 $256.00 $0.00

Grand total $79,087.00 $74,250.00

Delivery date 90-120 days ARO 60-90 days 

Item #6 Qty

Landmark 

Dodge, Inc

Shawnee Mission 

Ford

Don Hattan 

Chevrolet
Rusty Eck Ford

1. 3/4 Ton 4WD 4-Door Extended Cab  

Pickup Truck 1
$23,845.35 $26,714.00 $25,600.00 $25,363.00

Make/Model

2012 Dodge 2500 

Crew ST 4x4

2012 Ford F-250  

Ext. Cab 4x4

2012 Chevrolet 

Silverado 2500HD 

4WD Ext. Cab

2012 Ford F-250 

Super Cab 4WD

2. Manuals - One Complete Set 1 $0.00 $256.00 $0.00 $149.00

Grand total $23,845.35 $26,970.00 $25,600.00 $25,512.00

Delivery date 60-90 days 90-120 days ARO 60-90 days 7-8 weeks
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Item #7 Qty

Landmark Dodge, 

Inc

Shawnee Mission 

Ford

Don Hattan 

Chevrolet
Rusty Eck Ford

1. Full Size 1/2 Ton Pickup Trucks 2

$19,863.35 ea.  

$39,726.70

$18,396.00 ea. 

$36,792.00

$16,950.00 ea. 

$33,900.00
no bid

Make/Model

2012 Dodge 1500 

Reg. ST 4x4

2012 Ford F-150 

Reg. Cab 4x2

2012 Chevrolet 

Silverado 1500 

2WD Reg. Cab

2. Manuals - One Complete Set 1 $0.00 $256.00 $0.00

Grand total $39,726.70 $37,048.00 $33,900.00

Delivery date 60-90 days 90-120 days ARO 60-90 days 

Item #8 Qty

Landmark Dodge, 

Inc

Shawnee Mission 

Ford

Don Hattan 

Chevrolet
Rusty Eck Ford

1. Full Size 1/2 Ton Extended Cab Pickup 

Truck 1
no bid $21,166.00 $21,300.00 no bid

Make/Model

2012 Ford F-150  

Ext. Cab 4x2

2012 Chevrolet 

Silverado 1500 

2WD Ext. Cab

2. Manuals - One Complete Set 1 $256.00 $0.00

Grand total $21,422.00 $21,300.00

Delivery date 90-120 days ARO 60-90 days 
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Item #9 Qty

Landmark Dodge, 

Inc

Shawnee Mission 

Ford

Don Hattan 

Chevrolet
Rusty Eck Ford

1. Light Extended Cab Trucks 4
no bid no bid

$16,800.00 ea. 

$67,200.00
no bid

Make/Model

2012 Chevrolet 

Colorado 2WD 

Ext. Cab Work 

Truck

2. Manuals - One Complete Set 1 $0.00

Grand total $67,200.00

Delivery date 60-90 days 

Item #10 Qty

Landmark Dodge, 

Inc

Shawnee Mission 

Ford

Don Hattan 

Chevrolet
Rusty Eck Ford

1. 4WD 4-Door Extended Cab Pickup Trucks 3
no bid

$25,739.00 ea. 

$77,217.00

$25,100.00 ea. 

$75,300.00
no bid

Make/Model

2012 Ford F-150  

Ext. Cab 4x4

2012 Chevrolet 

Silverado 1500 

4WD Ext. Cab

2. Manuals - One Complete Set 1 $256.00 $0.00

Grand total $77,473.00 $75,300.00

Delivery date 90-120 days ARO 60-90 days 

Acknowledge Addendums N Y Y Y

Facility 

Maintenance 

Services, LLC

Marshall Motors
Sam I Am 

Automotive, LLC

no bid no bid no bid

On the recommendation of  Brandy McCune, on behalf of Fleet Management, Sara Jantz moved to accept the low bid for 

items 1-4 & item 6  from Landmark Dodge, Inc. in the amount of  $169,743.05 and accept the low bid for item 5, & 

items 7-10 from Don Hattan Chevrolet in the amount of $271,950.00. Jennifer Dombaugh seconded the motion. The 

motion passed unanimously.

These will be replacement trucks for Public Works (10), COMCARE (2), Judge Riddel Boys Ranch (1), Lake Afton (1), KS 

Pavilions (1), Code Enforcement (4) and the Sheriff Office (1).  Surplus will be sold on Purple Wave.  The current Fleet 

Policy is to replace these trucks at 90,000 to 100,000 miles or every 8 years; all trucks being replaced fall within the policy.
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UOM

Bob Barker 

Company 

Inc

Fruit of 

the Loom

Tabb 

Textile 

Co, Inc

Robinson 

Textiles, 

Inc

American 

Woolen 

Company 

International 

Inc

Carolina 

Textiles
ICS

Shoe Corp of 

Birmingham

O D 

Taragin

Uniforms 

Mfg Inc

CLOTHES

1
Bra Sports White sizes 32, 34, 36, 

38, & 40
dz $22.96

$5.14  ea 

no size 32
no bid no bid no bid $21.56 $28.60 no bid $21.22 $22.88

2
Bra Sports White sizes 42, 44, 46, 

& 48
dz $24.49

$5.14 ea 

no size 46 

& 48

no bid no bid no bid $22.66 $35.10 no bid $25.62 $24.10

3 Bra Sports White sizes 50, 52 & 54 dz $24.49 no bid no bid no bid no bid $23.76 $35.10 no bid $30.60 $26.54

4
Boxers small, medium, large & x-

large
dz $12.98 $22.28 no bid $12.25 no bid $12.08 $13.00 no bid $13.00 $14.34

5 Boxers 2X dz $13.98 $28.58 no bid $13.25 no bid $13.18 $14.30 no bid $14.00 $15.56

6 Boxers 3X dz $13.98 no bid no bid $14.25 no bid $13.18 $15.60 no bid $15.10 $16.78

7 Boxers 4X dz $14.98 no bid no bid $15.25 no bid $14.85 $16.90 no bid $16.20 $18.00

8 Boxers 5X dz $14.98 no bid no bid $16.25 no bid $14.85 $18.20 no bid $17.30 $19.21

9 Boxers 6X dz $14.98 no bid no bid $17.25 no bid $15.95 $19.50 no bid $18.40 $20.44

10
Brief white small, medium, large & 

x-large
dz $11.18 $11.11 no bid no bid no bid $9.79 $10.08 no bid $11.00 $10.37

11 Brief white 2X dz $11.76 $14.73 no bid no bid no bid $10.89 $11.38 no bid $12.00 $11.59

12 Suicide smock gowns ea $79.97 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $177.60

13 Panty cotton sizes 5, 6, 7 & 8 dz $7.98 $10.36 no bid no bid no bid $8.69 $9.43 no bid $10.14 $8.55

14 Panty cotton sizes 9 & 10 dz $9.72 $10.36 no bid no bid no bid $8.69 $9.75 no bid $10.70 $8.84

15 Panty cotton sizes 11, 12, 13 & 14 dz $9.98 $14.48 no bid no bid no bid $9.35 $10.27 no bid $11.25 $9.12

16 Shoes 7 oz step in sizes 6 thru 17 pr $3.12 no bid no bid no bid no bid $3.84 $4.23 $2.55 $4.96 $3.12

17 Sandals shoes bio-chek small to 2xl pr $2.64 no bid no bid no bid no bid $2.44 $2.73 $1.38 $2.48 $2.17

18 Belt tips dz $0.78 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $3.24 no bid $0.66 $0.75

19 Belt buckles dz $4.18 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $5.40 no bid $4.74 $4.84

      RFB # 11-0165

Description

4. CLOTHES, LINENS & TOILETRIES - SEDGWICK COUNTY CORRECTIONS  DEPARTMENT & SHERIFF'S OFFICE

FUNDING - SEDGWICK COUNTY CORRECTIONS DEPARTMENT AND SHERIFF OFFICE

(Request sent to 29 vendors)
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UOM

Bob Barker 

Company 

Inc

Fruit of 

the Loom

Tabb 

Textile 

Co, Inc

Robinson 

Textiles, 

Inc

American 

Woolen 

Company 

International 

Inc

Carolina 

Textiles
ICS

Shoe Corp of 

Birmingham

O D 

Taragin

Uniforms 

Mfg Inc
Description

20 Belt webbing color navy 50 yd roll $24.72 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $34.20 no bid $28.40 $33.84

21 Sock sport White 10-13 terry pr $5.84 dz no bid no bid no bid no bid $1.38 $10.08 no bid $0.56 $0.55

22 Sock tube white one size fits all dz $6.42
$19.84  

36/cs
no bid no bid no bid $4.53 $5.53 no bid $6.67 $4.68

23 Socks no show one size fits all dz $4.98
$15.72  

36/cs
no bid no bid no bid $5.45 $10.08 no bid $6.96 $5.42

24
T-shirt 100% cotton small, 

medium, large & x-large 4.6 oz
dz $26.99

$138.54  

72/cs
no bid no bid no bid $22.63 $19.50 no bid $25.20 $17.16

25 T-shirt 100% cotton 2x 4.6 oz dz $29.65
$218.64  

72/cs
no bid no bid no bid $33.64 $23.40 no bid $27.80 $19.03

26 T-shirt 100% cotton 3x 4.6 oz dz $32.79
$218.64  

72/cs
no bid no bid no bid $33.64 $27.30 no bid $32.20 $19.03

27 T-shirt 100% cotton 4x 4.6 oz dz $35.12
$72.44  

24/cs
no bid no bid no bid $33.64 $31.20 no bid $34.80 $21.84

28 T-shirt 100% cotton 5x 4.6 oz dz $38.12
$109.32 

36/cs
no bid no bid no bid $33.64 $32.50 no bid $36.80 $21.84

29
Crew neck sweatshirt small, 

medium, large & x-large
dz $6.12 ea

$156.12  

36/cs
no bid no bid no bid $73.88 $105.30 no bid $91.20 $89.70

30 Crew neck sweatshirt 2x dz $7.41 ea
$207.04  

36/cs
no bid no bid no bid $100.28 $124.80 no bid $91.20 $97.50

31 Crew neck sweatshirt 3x dz $7.95 ea
$207.04  

36/cs
no bid no bid no bid $100.25 $136.50 no bid $102.20 $97.50

32 Crew neck sweatshirt 4x dz $8.73 ea no bid no bid no bid no bid $100.28 $144.30 no bid $108.20 $109.20

33 Crew neck sweatshirt 5x dz $9.49 ea no bid no bid no bid no bid $100.28 $152.10 no bid $115.20 $117.00

34 Crew neck sweatshirt 6x dz $10.01 ea no bid no bid no bid no bid $128.70 $167.70 no bid $122.20 $132.60

35
Sweatpants, gray, small, medium, 

large
dz $6.84 ea

$158.50  

24/cs
no bid no bid no bid $81.25 $105.30 no bid $91.20 $78.00

36 Sweatpants, gray x-large dz $6.84 ea
$158.50  

24/cs
no bid no bid no bid $81.25 $105.30 no bid $91.20 $78.00

37 Sweatpants, gray 2xl dz $7.95 ea
$192.19  

24/cs
no bid no bid no bid $87.85 $124.80 no bid $91.20 $85.80

38 Sweatpants, gray 3xl dz $7.95 ea
$192.19  

24/cs
no bid no bid no bid $87.85 $136.50 no bid $102.20 $85.80
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UOM

Bob Barker 

Company 

Inc

Fruit of 

the Loom

Tabb 

Textile 

Co, Inc

Robinson 

Textiles, 

Inc

American 

Woolen 

Company 

International 

Inc

Carolina 

Textiles
ICS

Shoe Corp of 

Birmingham

O D 

Taragin

Uniforms 

Mfg Inc
Description

39 Sweatpants, gray 4xl dz $8.73 ea no bid no bid no bid no bid $101.05 $144.30 no bid $108.20 $101.40

40 Sweatpants, gray 5xl dz $9.49 ea no bid no bid no bid no bid $101.05 $152.10 no bid $115.20 $101.40

41 Sweatpants, gray 6xl dz $10.01 ea no bid no bid no bid no bid $107.75 $167.70 no bid $122.20 $109.20

42
Walking shorts 9", knee length, 

medium, large, x-large & 2xl
ea $4.17 no bid no bid $5.00 no bid no bid $5.31 no bid no bid $8.84

43
Walking shorts 9", knee length, 4xl 

& 6xl
ea $4.64 no bid no bid $5.50 no bid no bid

$8.31 ea 

4X     

$11.31 ea 

6X

no bid no bid $10.37

LINENS

44 Bags mesh white 18" x 24" dz $19.33 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $30.60 no bid no bid no bid

45 Bedspread 76" x 110" ea $23.64 no bid $17.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

46 Blanket beige 66" x 90" cs/12 $98.26 no bid $99.00 no bid
$6.00 ea  

70"x90"
$79.90 no bid no bid no bid no bid

47 Blanket 80% wool woven 66" x 84" ea $9.62 no bid $6.50 $12.00 $6.90 $10.25 $11.00 no bid no bid no bid

48 Blanket 66" x 90" 70% wool 3.7 lbs ea $7.19 no bid $6.50 no bid
$7.28 ea  

80% wool
no bid $8.00 no bid no bid no bid

49 Blanket 50% wool 50% synthetic ea $6.84 no bid $5.95 no bid

$5.98 ea  

52% wool  

62"x84"

$7.42 $6.80 no bid no bid no bid

50 Suicide Blanket 54" x 80" ea $70.29 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $86.67 no bid no bid no bid

51 Mattress 25" x 75" x 4" polyester ea $31.23 no bid no bid $39.00 no bid no bid $44.00 no bid no bid no bid

52
Mattress cover 25" x 75" x 4" 6-8 

oz off-white
dz $71.19 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $68.40 no bid no bid no bid

53
Mattress cover 25" x 75" x 4" 3.8 

oz
dz $85.12 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

54 Pillow poly vented white HD ea $4.75 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

55 Pillow poly/vinyl 20" x 26" cs/4 $24.22 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $24.84 no bid no bid no bid

56 Pillowcases 42" x 34" dz $10.99 no bid $7.75 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

57 Pillowcases white T130 42" x 34" dz $9.34 no bid $7.75 no bid no bid no bid $13.86 no bid no bid no bid
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UOM

Bob Barker 

Company 

Inc

Fruit of 

the Loom

Tabb 

Textile 

Co, Inc

Robinson 

Textiles, 

Inc

American 

Woolen 

Company 

International 

Inc

Carolina 

Textiles
ICS

Shoe Corp of 

Birmingham

O D 

Taragin

Uniforms 

Mfg Inc
Description

58
Pillows cotton core with microvent 

cover
cs/4 $30.64 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

59 Sheets flat colored 58" x 90" dz $42.22 no bid $71.00 no bid no bid no bid $68.40 no bid no bid no bid

60 Sheets flat white T130 66" x 104" dz $43.68 no bid $34.75 no bid no bid no bid $49.59 no bid no bid no bid

61
Sheets fitted white muslin 36" x 

80" x 6"
dz $34.71 no bid $42.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

62 Sheets flat 66" x 104" T180 dz $98.84 no bid $46.00 no bid no bid no bid $77.40 no bid no bid no bid

63 Sheets fitted 36" x 80" x 6" T180 dz $77.12 no bid $46.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

64 Towel bath 22" x 44" institutional dz $18.58 no bid $12.50 $18.00 no bid no bid $21.45 no bid no bid no bid

65
Towel white 20" x 40" regular 

institutional
dz $18.14 no bid $12.00 $12.00 no bid no bid $19.64 no bid no bid no bid

66 Towel bath 24" x 48" premium dz $32.99 no bid $21.00 no bid no bid no bid $40.00 no bid no bid no bid

67 Wash cloth white 12" x 12" dz $2.48 no bid $2.15 no bid no bid no bid $1.80 no bid no bid no bid

68
Wash cloth colored 12" x 12" terry 

institutional
dz $3.59 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $2.69 no bid no bid no bid

69
Wash cloth white 12" x 12" regular 

institutional
dz $3.54 no bid $2.15 no bid no bid no bid $3.59 no bid no bid no bid

70
Wash cloth white 12" x 12" terry 

institutional
dz $4.48 no bid $2.15 no bid no bid no bid $2.68 no bid no bid no bid

TOILETRIES

71 Hair and scalp conditioner 4 oz dz $18.85 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

72 Hair and scalp conditioner 7 oz dz $18.85 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

73 Styling gel alcohol free 7 oz dz $19.33 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

74 Hair dressing 4 oz dz $18.85 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $17.90 no bid no bid no bid

75 Comb 5", pocket, black cs/144 $3.26 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $2.25 no bid no bid no bid

76 Shampoo .75 oz cs/288 $65.22 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $36.80 no bid no bid no bid

77 Shampoo & conditioner 14.5 oz cs/6 $14.26 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $14.40 no bid no bid no bid

78 Shampoo balsam 8 oz dz $10.29 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $10.20 no bid no bid no bid

79
Deodorant, alcohol & scent free, 2 

oz
cs/12 $22.23 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $38.00 no bid no bid no bid

80 Deodorant, ladies stick 2.25 oz cs/24 $23.81 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
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81
Soap deodorant wrapped 

antibacterial .5 oz
cs/1000 $46.24 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $40.95 no bid no bid no bid

82
Soap deodorant wrapped 

antibacterial 3 oz
cs/144 $34.84 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $34.36 no bid no bid no bid

83 Soap box, 2 piece clear dz $2.57 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $2.81 no bid no bid no bid

84 Lip balm .15 oz cs/24 $32.08 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $13.84 no bid no bid no bid

85 Lotion 10 to 12 oz cs/6 $12.84 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

86 Twin blade razor cs/600 $48.17 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $162.00 no bid no bid no bid

87 Security razor cs/100 
$44.12        

500/cs
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $16.20 no bid no bid no bid

88 Shaving cream 11 oz cs/12 $14.94 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $14.28 no bid no bid no bid

89 Maxi-pads cs/576
$33.28        

500/cs
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $39.90 no bid no bid no bid

90 Maxithins long super w/wings cs/288 $32.73 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $44.00 no bid no bid no bid

91
Sanitary napkin, individually 

wrapped
cs/576 $39.80 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $39.90 no bid no bid no bid

92 Tampon non-vended paper wrap cs/500 $51.68 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $55.80 no bid no bid no bid

93 Tampon super non-vended cs/500 $55.64 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $69.00 no bid no bid no bid

94 Toothbrush 40 tuft soft cs/144 $8.33 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $5.85 no bid no bid no bid

95 Toothbrush no shank cs/100 $51.64 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $50.00 no bid no bid no bid

96 Toothbrush covers cs/12
$13.31       

144/cs
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $1.08 no bid no bid no bid

97 Toothpaste 1.5 oz unboxed cs/144 $33.14 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $30.60 no bid no bid no bid

98 Toothpaste 2.75 oz unboxed cs/144 $42.37 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $40.50 no bid no bid no bid

99
Shower mat 14" x 22-1/2" suction 

backed
ea $3.17 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $9.00 no bid no bid no bid

100 Fingernail clippers - no file cs/24 $6.72 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $10.80 no bid no bid no bid

101 Toenail clippers - no file cs/12 $6.94 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $9.84 no bid no bid no bid

OTHER ITEMS

102 Janitor carts ea $106.45 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $194.50 no bid no bid no bid

103 Mop heads ea $5.63 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $2.05 no bid no bid no bid

104 Mop handles cs/6 $46.98 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $45.00 no bid no bid no bid

105 Wet floor signs ea $13.45 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $14.70 no bid no bid no bid
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106 Dust pans ea $1.99 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $4.80 no bid no bid no bid

107 Mini Stereo ear phones ea $1.79 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

108 Radio AM/FM silver ea $4.80 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Acknowledge Addendum Y N Y N Y Y Y Y Y Y

Textile 

Sales, Inc

Derby 

Industries

Saf-T-

Glove 

Inc

no bid no bid no bid

On the recommendation of Dallas Shaffer, on behalf of the Sedgwick County Corrections Department and Sheriff's Office, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to accept the 

overall low bid from Bob Barker Company and establish contract pricing for one (1) year with two (2) one (1) year options to renew.  Linda Kizzire seconded 

the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

Question: Why wasn't the award broken out to various vendors?  There were nine (9) different low bid vendors and several only had one to two items. It was 

determined to go with the overall low bidder in order to manage the contract better.  Bob Barker was the only vendor who bid on all items and was the low bidder on 

42 of the items.  Last year, the county spent $24,000.00 on these items.
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      RFB #11-0168 

ASTM

Price per 

Lineal Foot @ 

42'

Price per 

Lineal Foot @ 

84'

Price per 

Lineal Foot @ 

126'

Price per 

Lineal Foot @ 

132'

Price per 

Lineal Foot @ 

168'

Price per Each 

End Sections

1.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 4'x2' C850 $221.28 $186.86 $175.38 $173.44 $169.64 $2,827.68

2.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 4'x3' C850 $214.24 $179.81 $168.34 $167.29 $162.60 $2,785.44

3.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 4'x4' C850 $225.62 $191.20 $179.72 $178.68 $173.98 $2,853.72

4.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 5'x2' C850 $239.46 $205.03 $193.56 $191.62 $187.82 $2,936.76

5.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 5'x3' C850 $231.51 $196.74 $185.26 $184.22 $179.52 $2,889.06

6.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 5'x4' C850 $236.61 $202.19 $190.71 $189.67 $184.97 $2,919.66

7.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 5'x5' C850 $245.21 $210.79 $199.31 $198.27 $193.58 $2,971.26

8.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 6'x2' C850 $251.06 $216.33 $205.16 $203.21 $199.42 $3,006.36

9.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 6'x3' C850 $242.33 $207.90 $196.43 $195.38 $190.69 $2,953.98

10.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 6'x4' C850 $249.66 $215.24 $203.76 $202.72 $198.02 $2,997.96

11.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 6'x5' C850 $259.17 $224.74 $213.27 $212.22 $207.53 $3,055.02

12.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 6'x6' C850 $275.40 $240.97 $229.50 $228.45 $223.76 $3,152.40

13.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 7'x2' C850 $272.31 $237.88 $226.41 $224.46 $220.67 $3,133.86

14.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 7'x3' C850 $259.53 $225.11 $213.63 $212.59 $207.90 $3,057.18

15.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 7'x4' C850 $284.87 $242.51 $228.39 $227.11 $221.33 $3,209.22

16.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 7'x5' C850 $297.27 $261.03 $248.96 $247.85 $242.92 $3,283.62

17.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 7'x6' C850 $306.87 $270.63 $258.55 $257.45 $252.52 $3,341.82

18.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 7'x7' C850 $313.80 $277.56 $265.48 $264.37 $259.44 $3,382.80

19.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 8'x2' C850 $288.18 $253.75 $242.28 $240.34 $236.54 $3,229.08

20.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 8'x3' C850 $296.99 $260.75 $248.67 $247.57 $242.63 $3,281.94

21.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 8'x4' C850 $308.11 $271.88 $259.80 $258.70 $253.76 $3,348.66

22.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 8'x5' C850 $316.21 $279.96 $267.89 $266.80 $261.85 $3,397.26

23.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 8'x6' C850 $324.27 $288.04 $275.95 $274.86 $269.91 $3,435.62

24.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 8'x7' C850 $331.61 $295.37 $283.29 $282.20 $277.26 $3,489.66

25.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 8'x8' C850 $351.84 $315.60 $303.52 $302.43 $297.48 $3,611.04

26.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 9'x3' C850 $319.97 $283.73 $271.66 $270.56 $265.62 $3,419.82

27.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 9'x4' C850 $337.11 $300.88 $288.80 $287.70 $282.42 $4,022.66

28.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 9'x5' C850 $347.58 $311.35 $299.27 $298.18 $293.23 $4,085.48

29.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 9'x6' C850 $358.73 $322.50 $310.42 $309.32 $304.38 $4,152.38

30.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 9'x8' C850 $374.04 $337.80 $325.72 $324.63 $319.68 $4,244.00

31.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 10'x3' C850 $351.66 $315.42 $303.34 $302.24 $297.30 $4,109.96

32.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 10'x4' C850 $363.02 $326.77 $314.70 $313.60 $308.66 $4,178.12

33.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 10'x5' C850 $369.35 $333.11 $321.04 $319.94 $315.00 $4,216.10

34.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 10'x6' C850 $308.95 $344.71 $332.64 $331.54 $326.60 $4,285.70

35.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 10'x7' C850 $390.36 $354.12 $342.05 $340.94 $336.01 $4,342.16

36.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 10'x8' C850 $397.93 $361.70 $349.62 $348.52 $343.57 $4,387.58

37.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 10'x10' C850 $462.39 $424.96 $412.50 $411.36 $406.26 $4,772.00

38.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 11'x8' C850 $465.27 $427.17 $415.21 $414.13 $408.69 $4,791.62

39.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 12'x3' C850 $401.00 $364.21 $352.63 $351.57 $346.31 $4,406.00

40.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 12'x4' C850 $434.73 $398.94 $386.31 $385.26 $381.05 $4,608.38

41.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 12'x6' C850 $454.73 $418.94 $406.31 $405.26 $400.00 $4,728.38

42.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 12'x7' C850 $464.21 $428.42 $415.78 $414.73 $410.58 $4,766.72

43.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 12'x8' C850 $483.15 $446.31 $434.20 $433.68 $428.42 $4,898.90

44.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 12'x10' C850 $506.31 $470.52 $457.89 $458.83 $456.84 $5,037.86

45.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 14'x14' C850 $838.04 $801.08 $788.04 $786.95 $781.52 $7,028.24

46.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 14'x16' C850 $978.26 $941.30 $928.26 $927.17 $921.73 $7,869.56

47.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 16'x4' C850 $746.73 $709.78 $696.73 $695.65 $690.21 $6,480.38

48.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 16'x6' C850 $766.31 $728.26 $716.30 $715.22 $709.79 $6,597.86

49.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 16'x8' C850 $796.74 $759.79 $747.42 $745.65 $740.23 $6,780.44

50.  Ea, Reinforced Concrete Box - 16'x10' C850 $865.24 $828.36 $815.86 $814.13 $809.56 $7,191.44

51.  Ea, Rubber Gasket & Geotextile Fabric $75.09

Delivery 4-6 weeks

Independent Concrete Pipe Company

no bid

Wichita Concrete Pipe Company

5. PRE-CAST REINFORCED CONCRETE BOX AND END SECTIONS - PUBLIC WORKS

FUNDING - PUBLIC WORKS

(Request sent to 14 vendors)
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On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Public Works, David Spears moved to accept the bid from Wichita Concrete Pipe 

Company and establish contract pricing at the rates listed above for a period of one (1) year with two (2) one (1) year optio ns to renew. 

Sara Jantz seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

Pre-cast reinforced concrete boxes and end sections are drainage structures, and they are often referred to as RCBs or box culve rts.  They are 

typically larger than round pipe and used when a round pipe will not provide adequate flow capacity.  They are fabricated off -site in a precast 

manufacturing facility and delivered to the work site ready for installation.

Each precast unit is typically fabricated in 6' cells, and they are put together in the field to make whatever length is required.

Several vendors chose not to provide a bid since they are located outside of the Wichita metro area and their freight costs would render their 

quotes non-competitive.
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     Req 10044905

Association of Community 

Health Centers of Kansas, Inc.

Annual membership renewal effective July 1, 2011 through June 30, 2012. $35,863.86

On the recommendation of Brandy McCune, on behalf of COMCARE, Linda Kizzire moved to accept the 

quote from Association of Community Mental Health Centers of Kansas, Inc. for $35,863.86.  Jennifer 

Dombaugh seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously. 

The association represents the entire system of mental health care for the State of Kansas and provides the State 

a single point of contact for the mental health care agencies. They also provide education, networking and 

education to the legislature on a wide array of behavioral health issues. Due to their efforts, $15.2 million in 

proposed statewide CMHC cuts did not happen. COMCARE's share of that would have been approximately $2 

million. Without the support and help of the association during the legislative session, COMCARE staff would 

end up in Topeka during the entire session which would reduce resources in the local community during this 

time. 

This item was previously approved by Bid Board on June 9, 2011, but the item was pulled before going to 

BOCC for further review by the Manager; Manager is ready to proceed.

6.  MEMBERSHIP RENEWAL - COMCARE

FUNDING - COMCARE ADMINISTRATION


