BID BOARD MAY 16, 2013 13-0378

ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL

2 ITEMS

1. HVAC SUPPLIES -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT

FUNDING -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT

(Request sent to 27 vendors)

RFB #13-0040 Contract

_ . Total
Price reflected as EACH W'Ch'ta Alr Kans?‘s Johnstone Supply Fastenal Filtration
Filter Supply Filtration .
Services
Filters

1. 10x20x1 2.07 2.00 2.35 2.4035 1.66
2. 10x59x5 1.15 3.22 No Bid 7.6600 7.36
3. 11x16x1l 2.07 3.02 3.66 3.9900 4.43
4. 11x45.75x1 6.25 5.89 7.90 9.4500 7.36
5. 12x20x1 2.07 3.07 2.47 3.1500 1.76
6. 12x24x1 2.07 2.16 2.55 2.7056 1.75
7. 12x24x2 2.27 1.93 2.28 2.6794 2.03
8. 14x20x2 2.43 2.20 2.60 2.8895 2.15
9. 14x24x2 5.35 4.82 5.19 6.6300 5.69
10. 14x25x1 2.59 2.46 2.89 2.9026 1.95
11. 14x25x2 2.77 2.48 2.93 3.2647 2.44
12. 15.75x65.75x1 8.93 8.32 13.00 17.3000 15.07
13. 15x20x2 2.53 2.27 2.68 2.6500 2.14
14, 16x16x2 3.81 3.95 4.85 3.0400 2.67
15. 16x20x1 2.03 2.07 2.46 2.3641 1.72
16. 16x20x2 2.24 2.15 2.53 2.8283 1.85
17. 16x20x4 3.80 4.19 5.52 5.7828 4.37
18. 16x24x1 2.63 3.64 2.44 3.2000 2.00
19. 16x24x2 2.75 2.38 2.82 3.2800 2.40
20. 16x25x1 2.33 2.12 2.60 2.3463 1.92
21. 16x25x2 2.49 2.41 2.89 3.2323 2.12
22. 16.25x25x1 5.39 3.94 2.60 5.9700 5.73
23. 16.875x16.875x1 4.39 3.69 3.92 4.0800 5.02
24. 17x19x1 5.05 3.67 3.70 5.2300 5.22
25. 18x18x1 4.39 4.07 2.75 3.0700 2.56
26. 18x20x2 3.59 3.25 2.80 3.2100 2.79
27. 18x24x2 2.84 2.49 2.94 3.0300 2.65
28. 19.5x30.5x2 4.59 5.77 10.49 11.0200 10.93
29. 20x20x1 2.31 2.20 2.74 2.3463 1.92
30. 20x20x2 2.49 2.40 2.93 3.2323 211
31. 20x21x1 4.82 4.14 3.73 5.9800 5.73
32. 20x22x1 4.82 4.14 4.07 5.9800 3.05
33. 20x24x1 2.59 2.46 2.89 3.4100 2.22
34. 20x24x2 2.90 2.63 3.10 3.3000 2.74
35. 20x25x1 2.61 2.48 3.02 2.6732 2.22
36. 20x25x2 2.79 2.73 3.34 3.7374 2.46
37. 20x20x2 2.49 2.40 2.93 2.6500 2.10
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38. 20x30x1 3.49 4.66 3.00 3.9400 3.33
39. 20x32x1 6.18 5.29 8.14 6.1400 8.35
40. 22x30x1 7.43 4.87 4,55 6.1400 8.59
41. 24x24x1 2.90 2.74 3.24 3.7879 2.27
42. 24x24x2 3.09 2.85 3.35 4.1919 2.78
43. 25x25x1 3.51 3.10 3.65 3.7700 2.58
44, 25x29x4 7.41 13.04 7.58 11.5200 7.79
45, 33.5x9x1 5.15 5.01 7.48 5.2300 6.94
46. 69.75x10.875x.75 6.99 11.58 12.79 9.9600 15.02
47. 8.25x43.75x1 5.09 5.01 7.48 9.2300 6.94
48. 8.5x27.5x.5 1.01 2.56 2.27 3.0900 4,73
49. 8.875x19.125x1 3.89 2.56 1.98 2.9300 4.42
50. 8.875x24.125x1 4.32 2.65 2.04 3.0900 4,73
51. 8.875x33.625x1 5.23 2.65 2.15 3.0900 6.60
52. 8.875x42.125x1 5.37 2.78 4.50 6.7000 6.94
53. 8.875x61.125x1 6.59 3.22 4,78 6.9700 13.28
54, 8x20x1 3.59 3.11 3.65 3.9900 4.42
55. 8x32x1 3.93 3.69 7.48 4.0800 6.60
56. 9x24x1 4.06 2.95 3.92 4.0800 4,73
57. Merv 13; 12x24x12 48.30 37.50 34.39 no bid 33.64
58. Merv 13; 24x24x12 69.95 53.50 45.32 no bid 48.41
59. Fiber Filter; 9.75x21x.75x1 2.22 2.65 2.04 no bid 241
60. Fiber Filter; 22x22x.5 (1/2 inch) 2.49 3.00 2.35 no bid 2.87
Brand Glasfloss Koch Flanders Koch Purolator
BELTS
61. 41240 4.62 3.03 1.5444 3.14
62. A4l 6.96 5.50 6.7375 4.69
63. A42 7.11 5.64 7.0224 4,79
64. A46 7.44 5.90 7.4305 5.03
65. A51 7.88 6.24 8.1158 5.31
66. B46 10.76 8.52 6.0255 7.26
67. 5VX530 27.68 20.87 13.9789 18.55
68. 5VX500 28.14 20.04 13.4356 17.82
69. 5VX530 29.29 20.87 15.5610 18.55
70. 5VX590 32.30 23.00 16.6009 20.45
71. 5VX630 34.77 24.77 18.7881 22.03
72. 5V X710 39.35 28.03 12.5741 24.92
73. B60 13.88 9.83 7.1369 8.37
74. B62 14.24 12.60 8.1646 8.60
75. B72 16.04 11.35 8.8302 9.69
76. B78 17.34 12.29 8.8302 10.48
77. B82 18.50 13.10 9.4144 11.17
78. B87 19.32 13.69 9.8355 11.68
79. B88 19.52 13.82 9.9306 11.78
80. BX40 12.51 9.34 7.7570 8.35
81. BX60 17.32 12.28 10.1752 10.68
82. BX62 17.80 12.60 19.9892 11.15
83. BX70 19.58 13.87 11.4929 12.29
84. BX93 26.74 18.42 15.2559 16.31
85. CX60 29.38 22.08 18.3126 19.58
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86.

5VX1120

87.

5V X530

88.

B73

89.

B88

90.

B89

91.

BX103

92.

BX85

93.

BX88

94.

3L-210

95.

3L250

96.

5V X1180

97.

4L160

98.

4L170

99.

4L.180

100.

4L190

101.

4L.200

102.

4L.210

103.

4L.220

104.

4L-230

105.

4L-300

106.

4L440

107.

4L450

108.

41530

1009.

4L550

110.

S5V X450

111.

S5V X690

112.

A20

113.

A21

114.

A24

115.

A26

116.

A28

117.

A36

118.

A37

1109.

A39

120.

A40

121.

A42

122.

A43

123.

A45

124.

A46

125.

A46 (4L480)

126.

A50

127.

A56

128.

AB3

129.

AX36

130.

AX38

131.

AX39

132.

AX40

133.

AXA42

134.

AX44

135.

AXA48

NO BID

13-0378
63.11 44.97 30.1451 40.00
29.29 20.87 13.9789 18.55
16.23 11.50 8.2597 9.79
19.52 13.82 9.9306 11.78
17.65 13.94 10.0257 11.90
28.31 20.05 16.6145 17.77
23.68 16.77 13.8974 14.87
24.36 17.25 no bid 15.31
4.35 2.88 2.3909 2.99
4.35 2.88 2.3909 2.99
66.55 47.40 71.3000 42.18
1.69 3.03* 3.1416 3.14
4.62 3.03 4.9973 3.14
4.62 3.03 1.5440 3.14
4.62 3.03 4.9973 3.14
4.62 3.03 1.5444 3.14
4.62 3.03 1.5444 3.14
4.62 3.03 1.5444 3.14
4.62 3.03 1.5444 3.14
5.00 3.27 5.0743 3.40
6.41 4.20 6.7760 4.35
6.53 4.28 6.7375 4.44
7.09 4.64 7.0070 4.79
7.26 4.74 7.1225 4.91
24.02 18.03 15.2845 16.04
36.08 53.55 23.4080 24.18
4.41 4.00 3.6806 3.46
4.62 4.03 4.1657 3.46
5.21 4.14 4.4506 3.53
5.38 4.27 4.8433 3.63
5.55 4.39 4.6508 3.74
6.32 5.02 2.2333 4.27
6.50 5.14 6.1831 4.38
6.74 5.34 6.5835 4.55
6.84 5.42 2.4000 4.60
7.11 5.64 7.0224 4.79
7.25 5.73 7.6153 4.88
7.41 5.87 7.8155 5.00
7.44 4.46 7.4305 5.03
6.70 4.46 6.6220 4.55
7.78 6.15 8.0234 5.24
8.31 6.58 8.4161 5.62
9.03 7.14 8.8165 6.09
8.31 6.27 8.4469 5.54
8.80 6.54 8.3083 5.81
8.91 6.68 7.0147 5.91
9.08 6.80 8.8319 5.99
9.35 7.04 8.5085 6.24
9.61 7.18 7.5845 6.42
10.02 7.53 9.1014 6.67
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136. AX49 10.14 7.58 8.0234 6.76
137. AX50 10.17 7.73 9.8945 6.81
138. B57 12.17 9.63 11.6809 8.21
139. B60 12.43 9.83 12.5741 8.37
140. B66 13.41 10.62 12.6665 9.05
141. B68 13.67 10.80 12.8821 9.05
142. BX38 11.96 9.00 12.9668 7.97
143. BX41 12.78 9.63 13.3749 8.53
144, BX42 13.05 9.83 14.2142 8.69
145, BX44 13.70 10.15 14.0679 9.06
146. BX47 14.27 10.82 11.2122 9.58
147. BX48 14.58 10.97 14.8533 9.72
148. BX49 14.88 11.14 11.5577 9.86
149. BX52 15.38 11.58 15.9390 10.27
150. BX62 16.74 12.60 19.9892 11.15
151. BX63 16.97 12.77 19.6042 11.31
152. M401182 4.00 5.43 no bid 20.00
Brand NA Gates Browning/*EJames Bando Gates
153. Other Supplies/Percentage Mark-Up 13% 20% Varies 230/;f(fdllissci;)unt 20%

QTab, Inc. Abatemel?t Midwest Machinery Comfort P&E.

' Technologies KC Products Commercial
No Bid Innovative AMC . GT Midwest -
. . Koch Filter _—
Building Industries, Corporation V\-/I(-:h.lta
Solutions, Inc. LLC Division

On the recommendation of Angee Sisco, on behalf of the Facilities Department, Linda Kizzire moved to accept the lowest and best
bid from Kansas Filtration for items 1-60 and 153 and Total Filtrations Services for items 61-153 and establish contract
pricing for one year with two one-year options to renew. David Spears seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

Facilities Maintenance and other staff will use this contract to purchase HVAC filters, belts and other ancillary supplies. A review
committee comprised on Pat Masterson and Greg Tuxhorn, Facilities and Angee Sisco, Purchasing reviewed each bid submitted and
unanimously agreed on the recommendation. Considerations include brand, overall cost and availability of all items in each

category.

These items are not currently on contract, annual spend is unknown.
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2. PAINTED PAVEMENT MARKING (R331) - PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING -- R331 TRAFFIC CONTROL MAINTENANCE & CONSTRUCTION

(Request sent to 43 vendors)

RFB #13-0055 SC # 8000010138

. . Advanced . . .
Engineer's Estimate: $ 182,850.00 Stre}lg_ht—Llne Workzone Cillessen & Sons,|Road Safe Traffic Traffl_c Control
Striping Inc. . Inc. Systems Services, Inc.
Services LLC
Application of Pavement Marking Paint $112,992.00 $132,000.00 $137,280.00 $166,320.00 $80,370.00
Addendum Y Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond Y Y Y Y Y
. - America’s
Hurricane L. Atlas Painting, Pearson .
. Stuber painting . Parking
Maintenance Inc. Excavating, Inc. .
Remarking Inc.
. . Wildcat
No Bid Dondlmg_er APAC Wichita McConr_leII & Comejc.) Construction
Construction Associates Construction
Co., Inc.
Nowak Ferauson Surface
Construction Pavigrl] Inc Protection
Co., Inc. 9. Services LLC

On the recommendation of Dallas Shaffer, on behalf of Public Works, David Spears moved to accept the low bid from Traffic Control
Services, Inc. in the amount of $80,370.00. Linda Kizzire seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

This project involves pavement marking for approximately 72 miles of selected County roads. Traffic Control Services has been a sub-
contractor before for pavement marking. Last year's cost was approximately $1,668.00 per mile compared to $1,116.00 cost this year.

13-0378



