BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS SEPTEMBER 1, 2011

ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL
3 Items

1. LEGAL RESEARCH SERVICES-DISTRICT ATTORNEY
FUNDING-DISTRICT ATTORNEY ADMINISTRATION
(Request for Proposal sent to two vendors)

RFP 11-0173

Westlaw Lexis Nexis
First Year $32,268.00 $29,700.00
Second Year $33,240.00 $30,591.00
Third Year $34,236.00 $31,508.73
Discount on Printed Materials -$19,255.05 N/A
Three year contract total $80,488.95 $91,799.73

On the recommendation of Kimberly Evans, on behalf of the District Attorney, Jennifer Dombaugh
moved to accept the proposal from Westlaw for the amount of $32,268.00 for the first year and
establish contract pricing for years 2 and 3 for a total 3 year cost of $80.488.95. David Spears
seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

Westlaw and Lexis Nexis are the only two firms providing these types of legal research services in
the country. Both vendors provided demonstrations to key stakeholders within the District
Attorney's Office.

Westlaw offers the CJS module, which is not offered by Lexis Nexis. Also, along with the 3 year
agreement, the District Attorney would receive a 50% discount on printed material already purchased
through Thomson West. Currently there is about $12,000.00 per year spent on printed materials.

Over the previous contract, the DA spent $85,906.04 on these services.
The question was asked as to why the contract was not combined with the Legal department? The

answer is that the two departments use different modules and have historically been on different
renewal schedules. This issue will be addressed when the contract comes up for renewal again.
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2. 3M PRODUCTS & SUPPLIES for FLEET BODY SHOP -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
(Request sent to 19 vendors)

RFB #11-0159

Esoalgle Qty O'Reilly \?\?lfll;\éerZ Keystone
per 237 | O Automotive | Automotive | Automotive
case | 4 Finishes

1. Roll, White Masking Paper; PN #06539 - 18" x 750" 2 | 2 if_gig iz iz(l)';g iz 2@;3; i‘;‘ iggg; 22
2. Roll, White Masking Paper; PN #06540 - 36™* 4 | 1 §151721_1§29; 22112; i:‘ igg‘;’j ii iggég i‘:
s s 2 | e | s | e | ke
4. Tube, Structural Adhesive - Urethane plastic; PN#08217 - 3 min* 7 6 §f§6?138€; $?2453é.1:6€; gfg;:ze; gfgll.lie(?s
5. Pack, Mixing Tips; PN #08193 - 24 element (green) 200 ml* 3 6 ;__? 2'?5’8635 2(13(())2,?5 ias‘ $$§ 3;?4166(?3 $$:4012 ZE:s
6. Ea, Premium Manual Applicator for mixing tips; PN #08117 - 200 ml 1 1 iég;?g ‘(3:2 igjggg ‘(3:2 2;222; ii iéiig; iz
s s a7 o | wme | wwe | e | e
8. Roll, Premium Automotive Attachment Tape; PN #06386 - 1/4" x 20 yds 2 12 3? 11;1565 Zecas 3? 1195 1956 Zecas $$11747871 2e:s ;; 11964%29 86(?5
9. Roll, Premium Automotive Attachment Tape; PN #06382 - 1/2" x 20 yds 2 12 $$ 32371'%5 Oecas $$ ; é) 6?224633 $$§1508; ;:S 532 ?? 9216 26:15
10. Roll, Overspray Sheeting; PN #06728 - 16' x 400' 1|1 :2;:32 : igg:gg : igggg ii ijg:gg ‘Zz
11. Box, Kit: Medium Liners/Lids/Rings/Plugs; PN #16000 - 25 oz 190 mesh filter* 4 1 221:2 i: 22221 i: iziﬁ ?:2 222;2 ?:2
12. Box, Kit: Large Liners/Lids/Rings/Plugs; PN #16024 - 32 oz 190 mesh filter* 3 1 255)813 iz 255)213 iz 23;;2 ?:2 22;2; ii
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On the recommendation of Brandy McCune, on behalf of Fleet Management, Irene Hart moved to accept the overall low bid from

13. Box, Kit: Small Liners/Lids/Rings/Plugs; PN #16114 - 80 0z 190 mesh 1 22322 Ei 22213 Ez 223;; ii 2228; iz
14. Box, Small Reusable Mixing Cups; PN #16115 - 8 oz 4 228% Ei 2328}1 Ez Eggz ii igggi iz
15. Box, Medium Reusable Mixing Cups; PN #16001 - 25 oz 4 $$ 12(? 4;,02506(?5 $$ 12176?06; ﬁigg ii $$ 125’ 6..7;66;
16. Ea, Large Reusable Mixing Cups; PN #16023 - 32 oz 4 22223 Ei 22222 Ez 2&%21 ii ié;gg iz
17. Box, Discs - Dust Free; PN #30767 - 6" w/1500 Grit* 4 ;Bfgé?olf(i i;fé_lfoe; ff;;éfoe; ;514;(5.78286(?3
18. Box, Discs - Dust Free; PN #30768 - 6" w/1200 Grit 4 $$f$;)7.,3450e§s $$25267'.7§2e:s $$f:7'?214e; 3?2500(5(.):6?5
19. Box, Discs - Dust Free; PN #01811 - 6" w/400 Grit 4 $$12183;.4§2e:s $$1322§.3£?4e:s $$12078'.2;2e; 3?12196?[:6?5
20. Box, Discs - Dust Free; PN #01812 - 6" w/320 Grit* 4 fff;:ze(?s ffzzé.sfffs ﬂ;$12078..2932€; 3?12196.3%54663;
21. Box, Discs - Dust Free; PN #01815 - 6" w/220 Grit* 4 fff;:ze(?s ff:z'?f;fs ﬂ;$12078..2932€; 3?12196.3%54663;
22. Box, Discs - Dust Free; PN #01820 - 6" w/ 80 Grit 4 ff;g;;; $$13584;.7800e:s jf;di?ze; 3?5(?9..854?5
23. Box, Body File Sheets; PN #60-4550-4969-6, 2-3/4" x 16-1/2" w/150 Crit 5 $$5862.,4A?5ecas $$55624?5e:s 55;49;';; sfjggjoefs
24. Roll, PSA Sheet Rolls; PN #02593 - 2-3/4" x 45 yds w/240 Grit 10 $$33668.?C?0ecas $$:118.§990ecas 533:5522;; 3?;6%?;10?5
25. Roll, PSA Sheet Rolls; PN #02595 - 2-3/4" x 45 yds w/180 Grit 10 $$33668.?C?0ecas $$:ll]fl880ecas 533:5522;; 3?;6%?;10?5
26. Roll, PSA Sheet Rolls; PN #02599 - 2-3/4" x 25 yds w/80 Grit 10 $$33668.?C?0ecas $$:ll]fl880ecas 533:5522;; 3?;6%?;10?5
27. Box, Roloc Disc; PN #01407 - 3" w/36 Grit* 10 s?;&f;; g;jd?goe; :22889'?22063(1 :S(?g.?:foe;
28. Roll, Fine Line Tape; PN #06404 - 1/8" x 36 yd * 12 :%égoe; :772'.2770(3; $$763',.1312efs $$86(5§()74e:s
Discount percent off of list price % na 41% 40% na

Acknowledge Addendums Y Y Y Y

POO;TS;SMO ASIUESII;t D\lir)g(;rlld BYK Gardner
no bid no bid no bid no bid |
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Sherwin Williams Automotive Finishes on pricing listed above and establish contract pricing for one (1) year with two (2) one
year options to renew. Sara Jantz seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

The Body Shop will order these products on an as needed basis and inventory items listed will not always be ordered together. The
discount off of list price will be used for any additional supplies not listed, as the list above consists of the most commonly used
products. The County spends approximately $10,000.00 per year on these products. The overall low bid was determined by current
2011 usage.

Note: GT Midwest would not guarantee pricing for term of the contract.
The question was asked if 3M was the only supplier for these types of products? Crystal Hester with Fleet Management stated that

there is another supplier for these products which Fleet has used on the previous contract but they have experienced problems with
some of these products and find them of inferior quality when compared to the 3M products.
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3. WEED CHEMICALS - NOXIOUS WEEDS
FUNDING - NOXIOUS WEEDS
(Request for bid sent to 20 vendors)

RFB #11-0152 Req 10045265

Oty Univar Red River Specialties Alligare LLC
Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

1. Gal, Dow AgroSciences, Tordon 22K 180 no bid $43.45 $7,821.00 $40.95 $7,371.00
2. Gal, Nufarm Credit 41 Extra 540 no bid $10.40 $5,616.00 $9.15 $4,941.00
3. LB, Drexel - 80% Diuron 1200 no bid $4.15 $4,980.00 $3.75 $4,500.00
4. Gal, Riverdal Weedestroy AM-40 720 $37.63 $10,837.44 $12.80 $9,216.00 $15.55 $11,196.00
5. Gal, Dow AgroSciences - Pasture Guard 100 no bid $46.50 $4,650.00 no bid
6. Gal, B.A.S.F. Habitat 50 no bid $53.00 $2,650.00 $50.00 $2,500.00
7. Gal, Dow AgroSciences - Remedy Ultra 50 no bid $55.00 $2,750.00 $41.25 $2,062.50
8. Gal, B.A.S.F. Plateau 20 no bid $133.00 $2,660.00 $114.95 $2,299.00
Total $10,837.44 $40,343.00 $34,869.50
Delivery Date as needed 5-7 days 4-5 business days

Qty VM Distribution Partners John Deere Landscapes Chem-Trol Inc

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

1. Gal, Dow AgroSciences, Tordon 22K 180 no bid no bid $49.00 $8,820.00
2. Gal, Nufarm Credit 41 Extra 540 no bid $15.36 $8,294.40 $11.75 $6,345.00
3. LB, Drexel - 80% Diuron 1200 $4.45 $5,340.00 no bid $4.20 $5,040.00
4. Gal, Riverdal Weedestroy AM-40 720 $14.00 $10,080.00 $25.00 $18,000.00 $12.93 $9,309.60
5. Gal, Dow AgroSciences - Pasture Guard 100 no bid no bid $61.00 $6,100.00
6. Gal, B.A.S.F. Habitat 50 $64.50 $3,225.00 no bid $65.00 $3,250.00
7. Gal, Dow AgroSciences - Remedy Ultra 50 no bid $158.54 $7,927.00 $72.95 $3,647.50
8. Gal, B.A.S.F. Plateau 20 no bid *$48.86 $977.20 $147.05 $2,941.00
Total $18,645.00 $35,198.60 $45,453.10
Delivery Date 5-7 days ARO 7-10 days ARO 14 days after PO issued

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Noxious Weeds, David Spears moved to accept the low bids for item nos. 1-3, 6 and 7 from
Alligare LLC for $21,374.50, item nos. 4 and 5 from Red River Specialties for $13,866.00, and the low responsible bid for item no. 8 from
Alligare LLC for $2,299.00, for an initial total purchase of $37,539.50 and establish contract pricing for one (1) year. Jennifer Dombaugh

seconded the motion. The motion passed unanmiously.

* Note: John Deere Landscapes quoted a product for Item 8 that is not an acceptable substitute for B.A.S.F. Plateau. The active ingredients of their

nfferina ic nnt in the came chemiral class nf nradiicts reaiiested
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