BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MARCH 22, 2012

ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL
9 Items

1.2012 BITUMINOUS FRICTIONAL SEAL (R175-K) - PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING - R175 PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE - SELECTED RDS.
(Request sent to 25 vendors)

RFB #12-0034 Req 10047219

Engineer's Estimate: $1,093,288.50 LaFarge North America Cornejo & Sons, LLC
2012 Bituminous Frictional Seal & Pavement Marking $963,152.47 $1,180,738.41
Bid Bond Y Y

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Public Works, David Spears moved to accept the low bid from
LaFarge North America in the amount of $963,152.47. Tim Kaufman seconded the motion. The motion passed
unanimously.

Bituminous Frictional Seal is a thin bond overlay with aggregate that increases skid resistance, reduces road slickness
and protects the underlying pavement. This project will cover 38.35 (2-lane) miles of selected roads in the County.
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2.2012 NOVA CHIP OVERLAYS & PAVEMENT MARKING (R-175B) - PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING - R175 PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE - SELECTED RDS.

(Request sent to eight vendors)
RFB #12-0028 Req 10047166

LaFarge Aggregates] APAC - Kansas, | Cornejo & Sons,
Engineer's Estimate: $1,051,000.00 & Concrete Inc. LLC
2012 Nova Chip Overlays & Pavement Marking $1,053,576.00 $990,782.60 $998,628.00
Bid Bond Y Y Y

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Public Works, David Spears moved to accept the low bid
from APAC - Kansas, Inc. in the amount of $990,782.60. Linda Kizzire seconded the motion. The motion

passed unanimously.

Nova Chip overlays are one of the tools used by Public Works to prolong the life of a road by adding a 1/2"
overlay. This preventive maintenance program involves 34.5 lane miles of selected roads for 2012.
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3. ERGONOMIC ASSESSMENTS and TRAINING - RISK MANAGEMENT
FUNDING - RISK MANAGEMENT

(Request sent to 11 vendors)
RFP #12-0025

Progressive

ErgoAbility Rehabilitation Worksafe Physical
The Alaris Group, Inc. | Occupational Therapy Management, Inc. Therapy, Inc.
$225.00 ea. $|7u i?:lllzzug
$350.00 ea. (Lst shift) P cll hi ﬁsg’ $168.00 ea.
(all shifts) $275.00/ea. (all shifts)
(2nd-3rd shifts) (average 2-3 hours per
Fee for Ergonomic Assessments evaluation)
$75:00/hour pl_us travel $150.00/hour $75.00./hour $112.50/hour
Fee for Training Sessions time and mileage plus mileage
Risk Management Athletic &
Services Rehabilitation Center Humanscale Care Solutions
$90.00/hour $350.00 ea.
(minimum 8 hrs.) (Lst shift no bid no bid
' $500.00 ea

Fee for Ergonomic Assessments

plus expenses

(2nd-3rd shifts)

Fee for Training Sessions

$1,200.00/day
Cost + 12% (materials)
plus expenses

$150.00/hour

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Risk Management, Tim Kaufman moved to accept the proposal from
Worksafe Physical Therapy, Inc. at the rates above and establish contract pricing for three (3) years with two (2) one-year
options to renew. Sara Jantz seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

A committee comprised of Mick McBride and Tammy Brandt - Risk Management, Lindsey Mahoney - ADA Coordinator and Joe
Thomas - Purchasing evaluated all of the proposals submitted for qualifications, methodology, and cost of services. Five (5) vendors
were shortlisted, interviews conducted and references checked.

The committee chose Worksafe Physical Therapy, Inc. as having the best overall proposal.

Ergonomic assessments will represent the majority of the services required from the chosen vendor. Periodically, training sessions
will be scheduled with groups of County personnel for cost savings. The methodology and cost per assessment provided by
Worksafe Physical Therapy was considered the best among the group.

Question: How many assessments are conducted per year? Mick McBride responded there are, on average, 40-45 assessments,

annually.
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4. 2012 DODGE CHARGER POLICE VEHICLE -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

(Request sent to 13 vendors)
RFB #12-0038 Req 10047252

Qty Briggs Chrysler Nelson Auto Center
Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
1. 2012 Dodge Charger Police Vehicle 3 $26,563.00 $79,689.00 $27,147.00 $81,441.00
Make/Model 2012 Dodge Charger 2012 Dodge Charger
2. Manuals - One Complete Set 3 $0.00 $0.00 NA NA
Grand total $79,689.00 $81,441.00
Delivery date 90 days ARO 60-90 days
Acknowledge Addenda Y Y
Qty Winfield Motor Co. Marshall Motor Co.
Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
1. 2012 Dodge Charger Police Vehicle 3 $27,120.00 $81,360.00 $27,512.00 $55,024.00*
Make/Model 2012 Dodge Charger 2012 Dodge Charger
2. Manuals - One Complete Set 3 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Grand total $81,360.00 $55,024.00*
Delivery date 90-120 days, up to 180 days 90 days
Acknowledge Addenda Y N*
Qty Resnik Motors, Inc. Davis-Moore Automotive Inc.
Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
1. 2012 Dodge Charger Police Vehicle 3 $27,419.00 $82,257.00 $26,906.71 $80,720.13
Make/Model 2012 Dodge Charger 2012 Dodge Charger
2. Manuals - One Complete Set 3 $0.00 $0.00 $50.00 $150.00
Grand total $82,257.00 $80,870.13
Delivery date 90-120 days, up to 180 days 90-120 days

Acknowledge Addenda

Y

Y

* Quantity was changed on addendum #1 from two (2) vehicles to three (3).

On the recommendation of Brandy McCune, on behalf of Fleet Management, Sara Jantz moved to accept the low bid
from Briggs Chrysler for the amount of $79,689.00. Tim Kaufman seconded the motion. The motion passed 3 to 1,

with Linda Kizzire voting no.

These are replacement vehicles for the Sheriff's Office. The Ford Crown Victoria was the County's standard patrol
vehicle and is no longer available; therefore, the Sheriff 's Office is going to test each make and model (Ford,
Chevrolet, Dodge) of patrol vehicles offered to determine what the new County standard will be in the future. Surplus

will be sold on Purple Wave.

Note: Briggs Chrysler is located in Lawrence, Kansas.
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Comments:

Linda Kizzire stated, "For the price difference of $1,181.13 between Davis Moore and Briggs, and the fact that Davis
Moore, on that dealership alone, pays over $128,000 in taxes, | feel that we should purchase from Davis Moore
Automotive since they are a local vendor."

Sara Jantz stated, "Just to make sure we have it in the record, | understand that the policy is that we don't have a
stipulation that within a certain range we can buy from a local vendor; it is just the lowest reasonable bid, correct?"

Joe Thomas stated that Sedgwick County does not have a local preference policy. As part of our process, we utilize
K.S.A. 75-3740a, a Kansas statute that allows us to consider another jurisdiction's procurement policy including any
local preference, in the County's evaluation of responses received. For example, if an out-of-state vendor submits the
lowest bid and it is determined they have a local preference policy, we can consider their policy when evaluating the
response prior to award. The advantage would then be applied to domiciled (Kansas) vendor. Since both of the vendors
mentioned in this bid (Briggs Chrysler -- Lawrence, KS and Davis-Moore -- Wichita, KS) are domiciled vendors, this
would not apply.
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5. 2013 FORD UTILITY POLICE INTERCEPTOR -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

(Request sent to 27 vendors)
RFB #12-0035 Req 10047250

Qty Rusty Eck Ford Shawnee Mission Ford
Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
1. 2013 Ford Utility Police Interceptor 2 $26,697.00 $53,394.00 $26,607.00 $53,214.00
Make/Model 2013 Ford 2013 Ford
2. Manuals - One Complete Set 2 $170.00 $340.00 $179.00 $358.00
Grand total $53,734.00 $53,572.00
Delivery date 12-14 weeks 90-120 days
Acknowledge Addendum Y Y
Qty Nelson Auto Center
Unit Price Ext Price
1. 2013 Ford Utility Police Interceptor 2 $27,096.00 $54,192.00
Make/Model 2013 Ford
2. Manuals - One Complete Set 2 $140.00 $280.00
Grand total $54,472.00

Delivery date

75-90 days ARO

Acknowledge Addendum

Y

On the recommendation of Brandy McCune, on behalf of Fleet Management, David Spears moved to accept the low
bid from Shawnee Mission Ford in the amount of $53,572.00. Sara Jantz seconded the motion. The motion passed 3

to 1, with Linda Kizzire voting no.

These are replacement vehicles for the Sheriff's Office. These vehicles will be used as part of the test to see which

patrol vehicle will be used as the County standard in the future since the Ford Crown Victoria is no longer available.

Surplus will be sold on Purple Wave.

Note: Shawnee Mission Ford is located in Shawnee, Kansas.
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6. 2013 FORD SEDAN POLICE INTERCEPTORS -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

(Request sent to 27 vendors)
RFB #12-0036 Req 10047251

Oty Rusty Eck Ford Nelson Auto Center
Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
1. 2013 Ford Sedan Police Interceptors 2 $27,977.00 $55,954.00 $28,382.00 $56,764.00
2013 Ford Sedan Police Interceptor | 2013 Ford Sedan Police Interceptor
Make/Model
2. Manuals - One Complete Set 2 $170.00 $340.00 $140.00 $280.00
Grand total $56,294.00 $57,044.00
Delivery date 12-14 weeks 75-90 days
Qty Shawnee Mission Ford Rob Sight Ford
Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
1. 2013 Ford Sedan Police Interceptors 2 $27,886.00 $55,772.00 No Bid
2013 Ford Sedan Police
Make/Model Interceptor
2. Manuals - One Complete Set 2 $179.00 $358.00
Grand total $56,130.00

Delivery date

90-120 days ARO

On the recommendation of Brandy McCune, on behalf of Fleet Management, Tim Kaufman moved to accept the low
bid from Shawnee Mission Ford in the amount of $56,130.00. David Spears seconded the motion. The motion

passed 3 to 1, with Linda Kizzire voting no.

These are replacement vehicles for the Sheriff's Office. These vehicles will be used as part of the test to see which
patrol vehicle will be used as the County standard in the future since the Ford Crown Victoria is no longer available.

Surplus will be sold on Purple Wave.

Note: Shawnee Mission Ford is located in Shawnee, Kansas.
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7. RUBBER TIRE EXCAVATORS -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
(Request sent to 20 vendors)

RFP #12-0014 Req 10047253 Qty
Murphy Tractor &
Sellers Murphy Tractor & Equipment Co GW Van Keppel
Equipment Victor L. Phillips] Equipment Co. Alternate #1 GW Van Keppel Alternate #1
$185,993.00 ea. | 179,628.00 ea. $233,158.00 ea $208,248.00 ea $239,444.00 ea. | $199,484.00 ea.
Rubber Tire Excavators 2 $371,986.00 $359,256.00 $466,316.00 $416,496.00 $478,888.00 $398,968.00
Hyundai John Deere John Deere  190D- Volvo Volvo
Make/Model Doosan DX210W 210W-9 220D-W w EW210D EW180D
$250.00 ea. $75.00 ea $75.00 ea
Operator Manuals 2 $500.00 74.04 ea $148.08 $0.00 $0.00 $150.00 $150.00
Parts Manual 1 NA $102.84 $0.00 $0.00 $125.00 $125.00
Repair Manual 1 $400.00 $83.34 $240.00 $240.00 $215.00 $215.00
Grand Total $372,886.00 $359,590.26 $466,566.00 $416,736.00 $479,378.00 $399,458.00
Machine in stock -
90 days or less -1 bucket and
Delivery Date in stock 90-120 days | 90 days + trucking | attachment 6 weeks. 90-120 days 150-180 days
Prairieland
No Bid Partners Bobcat of Salina John Deere Foley Equipment

On the recommendation of Brandy McCune, on behalf of Fleet Management, Linda Kizzire moved to accept the proposal for Murphy Tractor &
Equipment Co. in the amount of $466,566.00. David Spears seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

Rex Victory -Fleet Management, and Brandy McCune-Purchasing reviewed each proposal. Staff from Public Works, Fleet Management, and Purchasing
attended demonstrations of each machine proposed, except for the Volvo EW210D; GW Van Keppel did not have a machine available to demo. The
machines were evaluated based on initial purchase price, ease of operation, technical rating, maintenance cost, safety features, and warranty. All were in
agreement that the John Deere 220D-W best meets the needs of the County.

These machines are used by Public Works on a daily basis for cleaning and removing debris from ditches, bridges, and streams that cause drainage
problems. They are also used to load dirt or debris into trucks for removal. The clam shell bucket allows for removal of fence posts, sign posts, and tree
stumps. The wheeled excavator can be driven to the work site instead of being hauled like the tracked excavator. A future use of these machines will be
assisting in repairing old wooden bridges throughout the County that are being replaced with concrete boxes. These machines will aid in lifting and
installing of the concrete boxes.

The machine that Murphy Tractor and GW Van Keppel bid as alternates are smaller machines and do not meet specifications. The Hyundai 210W-9 did
not meet specifications on the bucket. During the demo the of the Hyundai machine, it was low on power and could not swing uphill with the loaded
bucket, which is a common use when cleaning out ditches. Also, both cylinders were leaking oil on the machine; the machine had very few hours on it to
have this type of problem.
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On the Doosan DX 210W the forward/reverse lever is on the column instead of on the floor or a joystick. Having the forward/reverse control lever on the
column could be unsafe in some work procedures, like setting culverts such as lock joint (concrete). During this procedure, a concrete piece is hanging in
the air while other coworkers are helping hold onto the piece as it is moved into place. The operator needs to move excavator forward or backwards and as
this happens, the operator would have to remove his hand from the joystick to the control lever. By doing that, the operator could bump the hand lever and
inadvertently drop the load or move the load, causing damage to culvert, machine or accidental injury to coworkers. Having the forward/reverse controller
on the joystick or a foot pedal allows the operator to control the load and move the machine without removing their hand from the joystick at any time to
complete the job. The operators also stated that visibility was poor out of the right side of the machine; it is important to be able to see any oncoming
traffic while working on County roads. The machine is constantly swinging from the ditch to the truck, and the operator must be able to see both sides of
the machine. The John Deere 220D-W had plenty of power with a loaded bucket, forward/reverse controller is located on the joystick, and it had good
visibility around the whole machine. John Deere has moved the boom back behind the operator station to increase visibility out of all windows. Machine
had easy access to component areas and also had non-slip material on steps and working areas for safety, as well as good fuel economy.

These are replacements for the East Yard and Clonmel Yard. The machines being replaced are 1998 Caterpillars; the life expectancy for the machines is
12-15 years. Surplus will be sold on Purple Wave.
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8. VARIOUS PAPER STOCK -- DIVISION OF INFORMATION AND OPERATIONS
FUNDING -- VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS

(Request sent to 22 vendors)
RFP #12-0043

Southwest Paper

Weight Unisource Company
. 8.5x11 White
Virgin Cost/Case $31.10 $29.90
Recycled Cost/Case 20LB
Brand Econosource Versicopy
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
. 8.5x11 Blue
Virgin Cost/Case $43.75 $42.70
Recycled Cost/Case 20LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
. 8.5x11 Canary
Virgin Cost/Case $43.75 $42.70
Recycled Cost/Case 20LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
. 8.5X11 Green
Virgin Cost/Case $43.75 $42.70
Recycled Cost/Case 20LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
. 8.5x11 Pink
Virgin Cost/Case $43.75 $42.70
Recycled Cost/Case 20LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
. 8.5x11 Tan
Virgin Cost/Case $43.75 $42.70
Recycled Cost/Case 20LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
. 8.5x11 Salmon
Virgin Cost/Case $43.75 $42.70
Recycled Cost/Case 20LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
. 8.5x14 Orchid
Virgin Cost/Case $43.75 $42.70
Recycled Cost/Case 20LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
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9. 8.5x14 White

Virgin Cost/Case $48.00 $48.74
Recycled Cost/Case 20LB
Brand Econosource Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
10. 8.5x11 Bright White Cover
Virgin Cost/Case $51.44 $58.52
Recycled Cost/Case 80 LB
Brand Starbrite Cougar Digital
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
11. 8.5x11 Index White
Virgin Cost/Case $48.30 $44.74
Recycled Cost/Case 110 LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
12. 8.5x11 Index Blue
Virgin Cost/Case $48.30 $45.90
Recycled Cost/Case 110 LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
13. 8.5x11 Index Canary
Virgin Cost/Case $48.30 $48.40
Recycled Cost/Case 110 LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
14. 8.5x11 Index Cherry
Virgin Cost/Case $48.30 $48.70
Recycled Cost/Case 110 LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
15. 8.5x11 Index Green
Virgin Cost/Case $48.30 $48.70
Recycled Cost/Case 110 LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
16. 8.5x11 Index Ivory
Virgin Cost/Case $48.30 $51.42
Recycled Cost/Case 110 LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
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17. 8.5x11 Index Salmon

Virgin Cost/Case $48.30 $45.98
Recycled Cost/Case 110 LB
Brand Domtar Domtar
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
18. 2-part Digital/Printer Pre-
collated Reverse Carbonless
Virgin Cost/Case 20 LB $176.00 $152.40
Recycled Cost/Case
Brand NCR NCR Superior
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
19. 3-part Digital/Printer Pre-
collated Forward (Straight)
Carbonless
Virgin Cost/Case 20LB $198.00 $159.07
Recycled Cost/Case
Brand NCR NCR Superior
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
20. 8.5x11 White-3 Hole
Virgin Cost/Case $37.55 $33.50
Recycled Cost/Case 20LB
Brand Econosource Versicopy
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
21. 11x17 White
Virgin Cost/Case $37.55 $35.58
Recycled Cost/Case 20LB
Brand Econosource Versicopy
Days to Delivery ARO 1-2 days 1 day
Convenience
_ Imaging Tek Computer Supply
) Quill.com Timber Creek
No Bid Paper Xerox Corporation
KK Office Central Poly
Solutions Corporation
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On the recommendation of Kimberly Evans, on behalf of the Division of Information and Operations,
Sara Jantz moved to accept the low overall bid from Southwest Paper at the unit prices listed for
three (3) years with two (2) one-year options to renew. Tim Kaufman seconded the motion. The
motion passed unanimously.

The base price of this contract is the bid price. Prices must remain firm for the first full term of the
contract. This contract will allow for price increases of no more than 10% per year.

Request for price increases must be submitted in writing to the Purchasing Department 60 days prior to
requested price change/contract renewal point. Requested price change must include a letter from the
supplier stating a price increase. Any price increases shall not increase the vendor’s margin of profit.
The majority of the paper used by the County is the 8.5 x 11 white copy paper.

Southwest Paper is the current vendor for these products.

Question: Why did we only receive two responses? One vendor could not meet the deadline, otherwise
it is not known.
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9. PTT INTERFACE FOR CAD SYSTEM-EMERGENCY COMMUNICATIONS
FUNDING-911 TELEPHONE TAX

Req 10047137

Northrop Grumman

PTT Interface to work with new
radio system $105,000.14

On the recommendation of Kimberly Evans, on behalf of Emergency Communications, Tim
Kaufman moved to accept the quote from Northrop Grumman in the amount of
$105,000.14. Sara Jantz seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

As 911 migrates from an analog to a digital radio system, the Push to Talk (PTT) interface must
be modified to function with the new P25 system. The PTT interface, a major field unit safety
feature, not only displays to the dispatcher which field unit is talking, but also permits the
person in the field to push their emergency button, on their mobile or portable radio, to alert 911
dispatchers the field unit is potentially in danger.

The existing analog system has this same interface. 911 is not adding anymore functionality but
having the interface re-written to work on the new P-25 system.



