
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 3, 2012

      RFB #12-0061  Req 10047134

Unit Price Ext Price

CQS-1F Emulsified Oil 11,000 $2.35 $25,850.00

Delivery Days

Vance Brothers

no bid

Qty

 (Gallons)

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.

24 hours after order

1. CQS-1F EMULSIFIED OIL - PUBLIC WORKS

FUNDING - R175 PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE - SELECTED RDS.

(Request sent to eight vendors)

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Public Works, Jennifer

Dombaugh moved to accept the bid from Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. for an 

initial purchase of $25,850.00 and establish contract unit pricing for one (1) year 

with two (2) one-year options to renew. Tim Kaufman seconded the motion. The 

motion passed unanimously.

CQS-1F emulsified oil is used as a sealant on the surface of the chat seal process.

Question: Why was there only one bid response received?

In surveying the vendors who did not respond, we found that several stated they could 

not be competitive with delivery of this product from their plant location.  Another 

vendor was late in submitting their response.  And another no longer supplied either 

product because they had changed their chemical formulations and did not meet the 

specifications requested.

ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL

6 Items



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 3, 2012

      RFB #12-0062   Req 10047150

Unit Price Ext Price

MS-1 Emulsified Oil 265,000 $2.67 $707,550.00

Delivery Days

no bid

Vance Brothers

24 hours after order

Qty

 (Gallons)

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.

2. MS-1 EMULSIFIED OIL - PUBLIC WORKS

FUNDING - R175 PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE - SELECTED RDS.

(Request sent to eight vendors)

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Public Works, David Spears 

moved to accept the bid from Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. for an initial 

purchase of $707,550.00 and establish contract unit pricing for one (1) year with 

two (2) one-year options to renew. Linda Kizzire seconded the motion. The motion 

passed unanimously.

MS-1 emulsified oil is used with the County's skim coat for revitalizing roads.

Question: Why was there only one bid response received?

In surveying the vendors who did not respond, we found that several stated they 

could not be competitive with delivery of this product from their plant location.  

Another vendor was late in submitting their response.  And another no longer 

supplied either product because they had changed their chemical formulations and 

did not meet the specifications requested.



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 3, 2012

      RFB #12-0063   Req 10047255

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

3/8'' City Surface Mix 2,000 $55.00 $110,000.00 $46.75 $93,500.00

Pick Up Date 5/7/2012 4/25/2012

Qty (Tons)

LaFarge Aggregates & Cornejo & Sons, LLC

Plant Location

3600 N West St

Wichita, KS

3050 S Madison

Wichita, KS

3. CITY SURFACE MIX - PUBLIC WORKS

FUNDING - R175 PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE - SELECTED RDS.

(Request sent to five vendors)

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Public Works, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to 

accept the low bid from Cornejo & Sons, LLC for an initial purchase of $93,500.00 and 

establish contract unit pricing for one (1) year with two (2) one-year options to renew. Sara 

Jantz seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

City Surface Mix is material used to patch potholes on County roads.



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 3, 2012

      RFB #12-0065   Req 10047090

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

1. 18'' x 6'' 4-All Way (R1-3P) 100 $3.46 $346.00 $1.12 $112.00 $1.46 $146.00

2. 18'' x 24'' Chevron (W1-8) 150 $13.83 $2,074.50 $4.50 $675.00 $5.80 $870.00

3. 36'' x 36'' School Crossing (S1-1) 50 $61.29 $3,064.50 $29.70 $1,485.00 $43.70 $2,185.00

4. 36'' x 36'' Stop (R1-1) 500 $41.49 $20,745.00 $13.50 $6,750.00 $17.00 $8,500.00

5. 24'' x 36'' Weight Limit W/Trucks (R12-5) 150 $27.66 $4,149.00 $9.00 $1,350.00 $11.60 $1,740.00

6. 36'' x 36'' Yield (R1-2) 50 $19.98 $999.00 $7.28 $364.00 $8.70 $435.00

7. 36'' x 36'' Ped Crossing (W11-2) 50 $61.29 $3,064.50 $29.70 $1,485.00 $43.70 $2,185.00

8. 24'' x 12'' Ahead (W16-9P) 50 $13.62 $681.00 $6.60 $330.00 $9.70 $485.00

9. 24'' x 12'' Diagonal Arrow (16-7P) 50 $13.62 $681.00 $6.60 $330.00 $9.70 $485.00

Grand Total

Delivery Days

Qty

Rocal, Inc. Osburn Associates, Inc.

Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, 

LLC

$12,881.00 $17,031.00

30-45 days 30 days NA

$35,804.50

4. MICROPRISMATIC LENS RETROREFLECTIVE SIGN SHEETING - PUBLIC WORKS

FUNDING - R331 TRAFFIC CONTROL MAINTENANCE & CONSTRUCTION

(Request sent to six vendors)

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Public Works, David Spears moved to accept the low bid from Osburn Associates, Inc. 

for an initial purchase of $12,881.00 and establish contract unit pricing for one (1) year with two (2) one-year options to renew. Tim 

Kaufman seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously. 

This is pressure sensitive printed sheeting that Public Works' staff apply to aluminum sign blanks.  This sheeting must meet certain specifications 

which include day and nighttime reflectivity.  This is an annual purchase anticipating the County's sign replacement needs.



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 3, 2012

      RFB #12-0066   Req 10047091

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

1. 18'' x 18'' Diamond 100 no bid $4.99 $499.00 $5.81 $581.00

2. 48'' x 48'' Diamond 50 $0.00 $44.48 $2,224.00 $51.24 $2,562.00

3. 42'' x 9'' Street Name 150 $0.00 $5.83 $874.50 $6.78 $1,017.00

4. 18'' x 9'' Horizontal Rectangle 100 $0.00 $2.90 $290.00 $2.91 $291.00

5. 24'' x 36'' Vertical Rectangle 150 $0.00 $13.33 $1,999.50 $15.50 $2,325.00

Grand Total

Delivery Days

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

1. 18'' x 18'' Diamond 100 $5.10 $510.00 $4.88 $488.00 $5.13 $513.00

2. 48'' x 48'' Diamond 50 $44.00 $2,200.00 $33.66 $1,683.00 $45.59 $2,279.50

3. 42'' x 9'' Street Name 150 $5.90 $885.00 $5.66 $849.00 $5.99 $898.50

4. 18'' x 9'' Horizontal Rectangle 100 $2.55 $255.00 $2.56 $256.00 $2.57 $257.00

5. 24'' x 36'' Vertical Rectangle 150 $13.50 $2,025.00 $12.68 $1,902.00 $13.70 $2,055.00

Grand Total

Delivery Days

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

1. 18'' x 18'' Diamond 100 $6.40 $640.00 $7.70 $770.00 no bid $0.00

2. 48'' x 48'' Diamond 50 $50.25 $2,512.50 $37.71 $1,885.50 $0.00

3. 42'' x 9'' Street Name 150 $7.03 $1,054.50 $9.36 $1,404.00 $0.00

4. 18'' x 9'' Horizontal Rectangle 100 $3.73 $373.00 $5.11 $511.00 $0.00

5. 24'' x 36'' Vertical Rectangle 150 $15.33 $2,299.50 $15.56 $2,334.00 $0.00

Grand Total

Delivery Days

$5,875.00 $5,178.00

Qty

Rocal, Inc. US Standard Sign

$0.00 $5,887.00

21 days

Qty

Osburn Associates, Inc. Vulcan Aluminum

Lightle Enterprises of 

Ohio, LLC

$6,776.00

NA

Allmac Signs

$6,003.00

No Bids

BRG Precision Products, Blasted Signs, AMP Sign Blanks, Inc., Safeway Sign 

Company, Metalform Industries, Inc., Designovations, Inc., and New Century

21 days

All Traffic Solutions

$0.00$6,879.50 $6,904.50

30 days 21 days

30 days 30 days

Qty

Newman Signs, Inc. Signotech, Inc.

5. TRAFFIC SIGN BLANKS - PUBLIC WORKS

FUNDING - R331 TRAFFIC CONTROL MAINTENANCE & CONSTRUCTION

(Request sent to 49 vendors)

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Public Works, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to accept the low bid from 

Vulcan Aluminum for an initial purchase of $5,178.00 and establish contract unit pricing for one (1) year with two (2) 

one-year options to renew. Sara Jantz seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

Traffic Sign Blanks are aluminum blanks used to replace signs that have been destroyed by vandalism and/or other 

environmental factors.  This is an annual purchase based on anticipated replacement needs.



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 3, 2012

      RFB #12-0069   Req 10047089

Unit Price Ext Price

1. 10' x 1.5'' x 1.5'', 12 gauge square 

telescoping steel sign post 10 $18.45 $184.50

2. 12' x 1.75'' x 1.75'', 12 gauge 

square telescoping steel sign post 100 $25.80 $2,580.00

3. 1.5' x 2.25'' x 2.25'', 12 guage 

square telescoping steel sign post 500 $4.30 $2,150.00

Grand Total

Delivery Days

Acknowledge Addendum

$4,914.50

Qty

J&A Traffic Products Designovations

no bid

21 days

Y

6. TELESCOPING STEEL SIGN POST SYSTEM - PUBLIC WORKS

FUNDING - R331 TRAFFIC CONTROL MAINTENANCE & CONSTRUCTION

(Request sent to 19 vendors)

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Public Works, Tim Kaufman moved to accept 

the bid from J&A Traffic Products for an initial purchase of $4,914.50 and establish contract 

unit pricing for one (1) year with two (2) one-year options to renew. Jennifer Dombaugh seconded 

the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

Telescoping steel sign post systems are adjustable sign posts used to support and mount various traffic 

signs.

Note: Additional comments made at Bid Board addressed why only one bidder supplied pricing when 

previously we had received several responses.  Two vendors were late in submitting their responses. 

Another vendor had delivery time issues with their supplier.  Another stated they could not 

competitively quote on steel products.


